
Subject: RE: Emelia
From:
Date: 06/20/2016 03:00 PM
To: "Maria Gomez" <maria.v.gomez@lacity.org>

That's what I was looking for, thanks.

Aaron Aulenta
Urban Place Consulting Group
aaron@urbanplaceconsulting.com

-------- Original Message --------
Subject: Re: Emelia
From: Maria Gomez <maria.v.gomez@lacity.org>
Date: Mon, June 20, 2016 2:59 pm
To: Aaron Aulenta <aaron@urbanplaceconsulting.com>

Hello Aaron, 

Okay here is the info I have regarding funds to be available in your bank: 

Figueroa Corridor is schedule to be available by 06/23/2016 in the amount of $345,228.89. 

North Hollywood is schedule to be available by 06/23/2016 in the amount of $125,509.40. 

Hope this helps and have a great day!

Maria Gomez 

On Mon, Jun 20, 2016 at 2:51 PM, <aaron@urbanplaceconsulting.com> wrote:
Hi Maria,

Is Emelia not in your office anymore?

I wanted to see when we can expect our assessment (from May invoices) to be direct deposited for Fig and NoHo?

Thanks,
Aaron

Aaron Aulenta
Urban Place Consulting Group
aaron@urbanplaceconsulting.com

-- 
Maria V. Gomez 
Special Assessment Section 
Phone (213) 978-1099


